
ENUMCLAW SCHOOL DISTRICT #216 

 

REQUEST FOR QUALIFICATIONS 
 

GEOTECHNICAL & WETLANDS CONSULTANTS 

 

Notice is given that the Enumclaw School District #216 is seeking proposals from qualified firms 
in the following disciplines: 

• Geo Technical Consultants 

• Wetlands Consultants  

Proposal must be received via email by Phil Engebretsen @ 
philip_engebretsen@enumclaw.wednet.edu, with cc to kyle_fletcher@enumclaw.wednet.edu  
no later than January 30th 2025 at 2:00 PM.   

The RFQ can be accessed at: 

https://www.enumclaw.wednet.edu/documents/district-departments/business/bids/321697 

Geotechnical Services and Wetland Consulting Services are requested to investigate and 
confirm site & soil conditions, and suitability for school construction. The total scope of work 
associated with the site investigation will be negotiated with the selected firm. However, it is 
anticipated that some Surface Exploration, and Subsurface Exploration will be completed for 
enough data to be collected and analyzed to provide a report outlining the risks and current 
conditions associated with site. The intent is to confirm identified wetland areas and buffers, 
Confirm/identify the soil properties and conditions to assist the Enumclaw School District with 
the site validation. The initial work consists of the evaluation of a 12.5-acre site located in the 
Ten Trails area of Black Diamond. The site is identified/proposed as the location for a 600-
student elementary school project. Upon completion of the initial site evaluation the district may 
choose to negotiate with selected firm/firms for further geotechnical and wetlands services 
pertaining to the project.   

The delivery method for the project has not yet been identified nor has an A/E firm been 
selected for the project at this time. The intent of the initial geotechnical and wetlands site 
investigation is to provide the Enumclaw School District with enough information to ensure the 
site is adequate for construction prior to engaging in further professional services.   

Proposals must include the firm or individual’s experience in the discipline for which they are 
applying. Please describe the services you provide, where you have provided your services, 
general company information and 3 references with contact information in no more than 20 
single sided pages or 10 pages front and back including tabs and cover letters. Minority and 
women owned firms are encouraged to apply.  

Please contact Phil Engebretsen via email with any questions or needed clarifications @ 
philip_engebretsen@enumclaw.wednet.edu. The district reserves the right to reject any or all 
responses to this RFQ. No fees or expenses will be paid or provided for costs associated with 
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the preparation of any response. Information received in response to this RFQ will not be 
returned. 

Selection will be based on the District’s evaluation of the received Submittals of Qualifications in 
conjunction with information received from reference checks to determine the firm most suitable 
firm/firms for the project.  


