Custodial Eq Bid Tab

Description Hillyard ConServ Flag Co. Pur-O-Zone Veritiv

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
KaiVac 1250 No bid No bid $3,809.94 No bid
KaiVac 1750 No bid No bid $4,489.32 No bid
KaiVac 1250 Battery No bid No bid $4,949.41 No bid
KaiVac 1750 Battery No bid No bid $5,521.58 No bid
Advance 250 No bid $3,195.00 $2,297.66 $2,496.00
Advance 351 No bid $4,819.00 $3,403.62 $3,697.00
Advance SC500 REV No bid $10,859.00 $7,658.57 $9,060.00
Advance ES300 XP No bid $5,050.00 $3,255.92 $3,536.00
Advance ES400 XLP No bid $5,959.00 $3,883.53 $4,219.00
Proteam GoFit 6 $482.22 $598.00 $427.28 $428.54
Proteam GoFit 6PH No bid $629.00 $692.07 $712.25
Proteam GoFit 3 $475.41 $525.00 $421.26 $422.51
Tornado CVD30 $523.17 $532.00 $418.80 No bid
Square Scrub EBG-20/C $3,183.67 $4,627.00 $3,102.50 $3,425.62
Doodle Scrub EBG-9 $991.93 $1,054.00 $838.98 $808.65
Total $5,656.40 $37,847.00 $45,170.44 $28,805.57

*2 or more - $2598.83

Recorded by Pam Steele 4.2.24



